SCOTT HUPPERT

Highway Superintendent Courthouse - 435 N. Park - Rm 204
Fremont, Nebraska 68025-4977

JEAN ANDREWS Phone (402) 727-2722

Asst. Highway Superintendent

June 12, 2023
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The following were in attendance for the opening of the bids for the 2023-2024
Road Gravel: Scott Huppert, Dodge County Highway Supt., Jean Andrews,
Assistant Highway Supt., Dean Lux Jr. of Lux Sand & Gravel, Dale Rangeloif of
Eveland Supply Co. and Glen Schuetze with Stalp Gravel, Inc.

At 11:15 AM., four bids were opened and read aloud: Dolezal Sand & Gravel,
Eveland Supply, Lux Sand & Gravel and Stalp Gravel, Inc.

Attached to these minutes are the bid tabulations.

Respectfully submitted,

Jean Andrews, ' \

Asst. Highway Supt.

Attachment
CC: File




DODGE COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

2023-2024 Road Gravel

11:15 A.M.Monday, June 12, 2023

Name of Bidder Dolezal Eveland Lux Sand South West Stalp
Sand & Gravel| Supply Co. Sand & Gravel Products Gravel Inc.

Webster % 25401 % 23.45 No Bid $ 26.00

Cuming % 24.95 No Bid $ 24.50

Pl.Valley ¢ 25.50 No Bid

Everett $ 24951 % 25.20 No Bid

Union $ 2435 1 $ 22.25 No Bid

Maple % 25.20 | § 25.50 No Bid

Platte $ 25201 % 25.50 No Bid

Pebble $ 24.95 No Bid $ 24.50
- [Logan $ 25.90 No Bid $ 26.00

Ridgeley 4 2550 | & 23.65 No Bid

Hooper $ 26.35 No Bid

Cotterell $ 2435 | % 22.25 No Bid

Nickerson $ 2610 | $ 26.45 No Bid

Elkhorn % 27.00 No Bid

Rd.Gravel Cu.Yd

Rd.Grave] Ton $ 18.00 | $ 27.50 | $ 16.00 No Bid $ 18.50

Fill Sand Yd,

Fill Sand Ton 3 3.75 | 3 1450 | s 3,70 No Bid $ 4,50

Conc.Sand Yd.

Conc.Sand Ton No Bid $ 21,50 No Bid No Bid $ 11.75

Fill Dirt Yd.

Fill Dirt Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid % 12.00

End of Bids




